
 

  

JAMES 1 

(English Standard Version) 
 

James 1:2  Count it all joy, my brothers, 
when you meet trials of various kinds,  
 
2  C i a j, m b, w y m t o v k,  

 
 

 
James 1:5  If any of you lacks wisdom, 
let him ask God, who gives generously 
to all without reproach, and it will be 
given him.  
 
5  I a o y l w, l h a G, w g g t a w r, a i w 

b g h.  

 
 

  

 
 

James 1:3  for you know that the 
testing of your faith produces 
steadfastness.  
 
3  f y k t t t o y f p s.  

 
 

  

James 1:12  Blessed is the man who 
remains steadfast under trial, for when 
he has stood the test he will receive the 
crown of life, which God has promised 
to those who love him.  
 
12  B i t m w r s u t, f w h h s t t h w r t c 

o l, w G h p t t w l h.  

 



 

  

James 1:17  Every good gift and every 
perfect gift is from above, coming down 
from the Father of lights with whom 
there is no variation or shadow due to 
change.  
 
17  E g g a e p g i f a, c d f t F o l w w t i 

n v o s d t c.  

 

  

 

 

James 1:20  for the anger of man does 
not produce the righteousness of God.  
 
20  f t a o m d n p t r o G.  
 

  

 

James 1:19  Know this, my beloved 
brothers: let every person be quick to 
hear, slow to speak, slow to anger;  
 
19  K t, m b b: l e p b q t h, s t s, s t a;  

 

  

James 1:27  Religion that is pure and 
undefiled before God, the Father, is 
this: to visit orphans and widows in 
their affliction, and to keep oneself 
unstained from the world.  
 

27  R t i p a u b G, t F, i t: t v o a w i t a, 

a t k o u f t w. 
 


